
Sohrab’s Channeling

20th October 2016

THE ENERGIES OF 2017

(Note: Sohrab chooses to hold a seminar, and speaks of the energies of 
2017.  He then ends with a brief channeling)

Sohrab speaks:

There has been a clear progression of events over the last few months:  we 
were first introduced to the current cleansing process, asked to rediscover 
the Inner Child in different ways and then briefly introduced to the 
high-frequency energies of 2017. 

2017 is a year of re-birth and re-creation of the self. So if you haven’t got rid 
of most of your inner garbage, if you haven’t worked on the Inner child, then 
things may get rough for you.  

This led to a meeting in which we were told that we are now changing, 
amending, tweaking and even negating some contracts that have been 
made by us, prior to this incarnation.  So even if a husband and wife have 
contracted to come together for a lifetime to learn lessons from one 
another, either party now has the ability to invalidate this contract. 

If one party does so, then automatically the other one has to upgrade or 
amend his or her contract, taking into account this new shift.  This sets off 
a domino effect: their children, friends, and work-colleagues will all be 
affected by this alteration, and will have to suitably amend their contracts in 
life.  In short, it’s going to be a year of astounding change. 

2016 was a year of great speed; 2017 is going to be one of even greater 
speed, coupled with breathless twists and turns at the most unexpected 



moments…a veritable rollercoaster ride.

As the year progresses, we are not going to recognize a lot of people.  With 
the dramatic shifts in contracts, a person who has always been a pushover 
may suddenly begin to display the courage of a lion. A person who has 
always remained safely in the background may suddenly take center stage.  
Someone who has pushed you around may start functioning with caring 
and humility.  Major, major shifts.  

And just as you won’t recognize them, they may not recognize you, as you 
will also make major upgrades in your structure, behavioral patterns and 
thought processes.   We have therefore been urged, from now, to make 
conscious choices of who we would like to be during 2017, and to start 
programming this into our future selves. 

We have been urged not to resist the changes of 2017; this is much 
needed.  And the changes are also going to affect our relationship with the 
other kingdoms of earth.  We are to welcome this. 

Now here are some new downloads that I have received.  Next year is going 
to have two Earths of different frequencies running parallel to one another,  
in this very reality. 

Let’s visualize this as two energetic roads travelling through 2017, one on 
the surface and the other floating high above it.  

The surface level road will contain what I call ‘the muck’: war, earth shifts, 
terror attacks, disease, intolerance and bigotry, further abuse of women, 
corruption and so on.

The higher road, equally accessible by us, will contain high-frequency 
energies available to all, breakthroughs in science, medicinal cures and 
technology, educational opportunities, the ability to live an eco-friendly 
existence, the ability to heal the self and other, and so on.

If I were to use layman’s terms, I would say it will be the ‘simultaneous rise 
of good and evil’. 



Our quest is to walk a tightrope across 2017, with a balancing bar in our 
hands, attempting at all times to remain in the higher frequencies.   If we 
fall into the muck, as we are likely to do from time to time, we are to pick 
ourselves up and climb right back on the tightrope. 

When this download came, I asked the Masters to please give me a 
tangible, practical example I could offer all of you, and in walked my next 
client…since her story is rather personal, I naturally asked her if I could 
share her story with you.  She has given me permission to do so freely. 

She is a single woman who has nursed her cancer-ridden Mother through 
great pain and trauma, till the mother finally passed away.  She gave up her 
job, stayed home, and did everything she could, mentally, physically, 
emotionally and financially, to make her mother’s last years comfortable.  
Though she is deeply connected with her mother, she has accepted her 
passage gracefully.

Last week she went for a mammogram, and the doctor discovered a lump 
in both breasts: one a tumour, which appeared to be benign, and the other a 
suspicious lump.   However, the doctor recommended the immediate 
surgical removal of both.  

Given the circumstances I have just outlined, so could so easily have got 
‘stuck in the muck’.  

The muck here would be thoughts like:

“My mother died of this disease, it’s surely genetic, and I am going to go the 
same route.” 

“Why me, when I have worked so hard on my issues?” 

“Poor me!” 

“I have served my Mother so faithfully, why is God striking me down?” 

“I must be suffering for past karmic misdeeds.” 

Instead, she has soared above all of this.  None of these thoughts crossed 



her mind.  She was instead in total gratitude to Meher Baba (as she is 
deeply connected with him) and to the other Masters, and her first 
statement was:  “Thank God I was guided to have this mammogram so 
speedily; we have caught this well in time!”

She then told the doctor outright, “I give you full, signed permission to do 
what you need to do.  If you can do a lumpectomy, that’s fine.  But when you 
operate, and if you feel there is the slightest doubt about the tumour and 
the lump, please do a double-mastectomy. ”

The doctor must have been taken aback by her ease and calmness.  He 
stated that if it was necessary, he would do so, and that he could easily put 
in silicone implants, which would then give her a completely natural 
appearance.

She instantly said, “No, thank you.  I don’t want a foreign body put in 
unnecessarily, which could lead to future complications.  I am perfectly 
willing to live the rest of my life with a padded bra.  I am not defined by my 
breasts.”

Friends, while she was speaking to me, I naturally checked out her energies.  
She could have just been putting on a brave front, and yet been in fear and 
denial.  She wasn’t.  She was in complete balance.  She was walking the 
figurative tightrope with grace and ease. 

Please salute her.  I don’t know how many women would have responded 
as she did.  And very few wouldn’t have wanted at least the appearance of 
‘normalcy’, and not asked for implants.

She is going in for surgery on Saturday.  I even offered to go with her, but 
she said she really didn’t need any help.  She then said, “I know my Masters 
are with me.  What more support do I need?”

Friends, this is a wonderful example of walking the tightrope.  She has not 
denied the lower-road reality of the situation, which is the possibility of 
cancer and a double-mastectomy.   But instead of getting caught up in the 
muck, she has chosen the higher road, which is equally real.  And that is, 



“Thank God that I was guided to discover this well in time!  I am fully taken 
care of.”  And because of this attitude, all will be well. 

(A note from Sohrab:  as I transcribe this a few days later, she is home again 
and well on the road to recovery.  The lump and tumour were benign and 
successfully removed, and her breasts have been left untouched.)

Dear Friends, this is but an example, but it applies to every part of our lives 
in the coming year.  All of us are going to face life-situations next year.  One 
person will have a court-case, another a disagreement with a husband or 
relative, a third may have problems at work, and so on.  Let us keep 
choosing the high road. 

Please do not mistake what I am saying:  I am not urging anyone to block 
out the reality of the situation or deny the muck.  Acknowledge the low 
road, but choose to walk the high road instead. 

This means that 2017 is going to be a year defined by your choices and 
your attitude.  I cannot say whether it’s going to be a ‘good year’ or a ‘bad 
year’.   The year will depend on how we perceive situations that occur: our 
choices will be to get enmeshed in them, or to soar above them.   The year 
is truly in your hands, and not in the hands of your astrochart.

I think a lot of this is already happening.  I have felt urged to drink 
pomegranate juice daily, and I do so.  And recently I got a whatsapp extoling 
the benefits of this juice.  I also believe that we can talk to our organs, 
discover what’s wrong with them, what the issues are, and work towards 
curing them.     And if, God forbid, I get a disease like Cancer, I would most 
certainly work at ridding myself of it in a natural way.  There are now so 
many options open to us…

Yes indeed, S.  I remind you now of a recent meeting in which we were 
specifically told that we are now capable of rewriting our contracts, even 
with diseases like Cancer.  A person can have had this for years, and can 
now choose to live a cancer-free life from 2017 onwards.   All we need is 
certainty.  Not just faith, but certainty.



Even here, the Masters said we had some leeway.  While on earth, with the 
limitations of the human brain, we are not capable of 100% certainty.  But 
they said that if we were even 95% certain, it would work.   Now, if we are 
only 70% certain, we have to work towards getting into the 90s; so it can 
still happen, but it will take a little more time. 

Now imagine: if you can chance cancer, what can’t you change?  You can 
change relationships, attitudes, belief systems, and your financial situation 
and so on.

What if it’s not in keeping with one’s higher soul?

A good point.  Yes, in that case, the change won’t necessarily happen in the 
way you think is the best for you, but it will take into account your 
conscious desire.  Let’s look at an example.   A wife in a troubled marriage 
could choose to change her contract and demand a harmonious 
relationship with her spouse.   

She could be visualizing a wonderfully loving marriage in the future, but this 
contract change could instead lead her into a divorce.  This may not have 
been what she consciously wanted, but it may be the best thing for both 
parties.  Then she will have to accept that outcome as a higher-soul choice. 

So let’s use this opportunity to write ourselves a wonderful Astrochart for 
2017.   I am, in no way, denigrating the skills of wonderful Astrologers.  But 
even if the Astrologer points out that you are likely to have a ‘rough patch’ in 
the month of April, you can now use your power to change this.  If he points 
out that you might have ill health in the future, use your power to take 
special care of your food, nutrition and body, and instead create the 
healthiest future possible. 

In the past, we have been given to understand that we cannot change the 
blueprint of our lives that we have created before taking this incarnation.

The blueprint is now fluid, along with the cornerstones we had placed in 



them.   This is what the Masters refer to, when they say that we can now 
change our contracts. Though this has been spoken of before, it bears 
repetition. 

When a house is being build, the architect creates a blueprint of the 
structure; a map detailing its various specs.   In exactly the same way, 
before we incarnate, we sit in conference with various Masters and Guides, 
and with their help create a blueprint of the kind of family, circumstances, 
events and experiences we desire for our growth and evolution.

So let’s say that a certain person decides to come to earth to study (my 
perennial example) how to move from victimhood to self-empowerment.  
This soul may then choose to incarnate as a woman and marry a certain 
man who contracts to play the role of the dominating, oppressive husband.   
Through these circumstances, she hopes to be able to learn to stand up to 
him and touch her power. 

Let us also assume that she has placed him as a cornerstone in her life.  
This way, come what may, even if she tries to leave him, it just won’t 
happen.  She has energetically bound him to her, so that she cannot evade 
learning the lesson. 

This was how things occurred in the past.   Today, though they have not 
vanished, both the blueprint and the cornerstones are fluid and changeable.  
Citing the same example, the woman can now decide that she does not 
want to learn self-empowerment through her husband anymore, and may 
actually choose to leave him and learn her lesson elsewhere, through other 
people.  Or she could actually choose to defer it to another lifetime.   Such 
is our power.

So what you are saying is that now we are fully responsible for our 
life-course and the events in our lives, and are capable of making any 
changes that we desire?

Exactly.  Now we can’t conveniently sit back and blame external 
circumstances, karma or destiny for so-called disasters in our lives.  We 



have to learn to take responsibility for creating them, and also learn how to 
shift them. 

Are most people changing their blueprints?

Not all.  Many choose to come and follow exactly what they had outlined.  
Some modify certain portions of the blueprint, but keep others the same.  
But it’s now changeable.  It’s no longer inviolable.

Though we have all this freedom, we generally don’t believe it.  So we keep 
re-writing the same story. “I am suffering”, “I am worthless”, “I don’t deserve 
to succeed”, “I am being punished for past misdeeds” and so on.  When we 
do this, we don’t realize that it’s the same story that we are rewriting afresh, 
and not a hangover of the past.   So why don’t we choose, instead, to write 
a glorious, pain-free future for ourselves?

I would just like to share that, after my last personal session with you, in 
which the Masters asked me to keep repeating to myself “I am worth it”, my 
whole life has changed around.  Wonderful opportunities keep coming my 
way, and now I just don’t say “No”.  I welcome them all, and they have truly 
enriched my life.  Thank you.

Bravo! (Smiling) I acknowledge that I am a good catalyst; but you’ve done 
the work, and changed your life around by rewriting your story. Bravo. 

Are the blueprint and the Akashic records the same thing?

No.  You create a blueprint as a guideline for what you would like to study 
while on Earth.  The Akashic records are what you study when you return to 
spirit, helping you review and evaluate the incarnation you have just 
finished. 

Now, before I start channeling, there is one last thing I would like to share 
with you.  I recently watched a young, 12-year old singer on YouTube.  She 
was a competitor in America’s Got Talent, and her name is Laura Bretan.  If 
you just type in those two things, you will be led to her first audition.  You 
will see her with raised hands, wearing a pink T-shirt with a heart on the 



front of it.

What struck me when I watched her was this: when she talks, she is just 
another lovely 12-year old child.  But when she opens her mouth to sing, it 
feels like there is another person ‘in her’.  Then when she finishes, she 
come right back to herself. 

Was she channeling?

Yes, she was, quite unconsciously.  What I got, when I connected, was that 
she was actually channeling another aspect of herself, in another 
simultaneous lifetime, who is a mature professional singer. 

Please watch this clip, and also take note of the energy change in the 
audience within the first few seconds of her starting to sing. It’s just 
amazing. 

Remember how the Masters have said that even one person can make an 
energy shift in the collective consciousness?  The clip of this little unknown 
girl has had millions of hits.  Imagine what an energy shift she has created 
worldwide.

They have also told us that a lot of child prodigies are going to be 
incarnating on Earth during this time period to awaken our consciousness.   
They are making waves in all fields, including science, technology and 
medicine.  But the Arts is the field which gets the most acknowledgment 
and viewership.  And I feel Laura Bretan is one of them.  

The latest aspect of 2017, which has recently been revealed to me, is that it 
is necessary to think out of the box and tap into our skills. 

Let me give you an example.  A friend’s young daughter, who loves cooking, 
recently asked her mother if she could enroll in a one-day baking course, 
being held on Skype by a well-known U.S. chef.

The course was expensive; it costs $ 200, but the parents gave this to the 
girl as a gift.  Apparently it was wonderful.  The young girl set up her laptop 
in the kitchen, and spent the entire day following the chef step-by-step and 



cooking along with her.  One could, apparently, also type in any queries, 
which would be answered by a person manning the keyboard in America.

The course apparently had 3000 applicants. Now do the math and see how 
much this chef earned in a single day, by simply ‘thinking out of the box’ 
and offering her expertise to others in a novel way.

So all of us have various skills, and we need to hone them and use them 
productively this coming year, most definitely attempting to reach out to 
others, so that they can benefit from them.

(A general discussion then took place, where may people voiced the fact that 
they had difficulty charging for services offered)

India has a script that says “Money and Spirituality do not go together”.  
Other countries don’t.  We need to break this script in our minds.  We must 
learn to value ourselves enough to feel comfortable charging a 
commensurate fee for our services.  In India, if I charged a huge amount of 
money for my services, many would consider me a hoax; whereas if I did 
the same in America, people would come running to me, considering me 
the best.

Whether you go to a surgeon or a spiritualist, you are paying him for his 
years of training, hard work and expertise that has readied him for the 
moment he now consults with you. 

I, of course, don’t suggest that you become excessively money-minded and 
heartless.  I have struggled with this issue myself for years, and now have a 
comfortable system in place.  The note on my energy-exchange box reads, 
“My charges for this session are Rs. …., but you are welcome to put 
anything into the box, depending on your current financial situation.”  This 
works for me.

Many of my clients are not financially stable, and I am happy receiving 
whatever they put into the box.  I also give several free sessions. But I must 
also be able to declare, in balance, what my charges are; because if I don’t 



value who I am, they won’t value my services. 

I just can’t take money for my spiritual sessions.  I ask people to bring me 
fruit or flowers instead.

Look, there are always exceptions.  Take the case of our group member D, 
who was extremely well-off.   She was in complete balance when she once 
said to me, “I won’t take money for my personal sessions.  The Universe 
compensates me financially in other ways.”  She really meant this, and it 
worked for her.

All I am suggesting is that you look inward, individually, and see if you are 
resisting the flow of energy exchange out of guilt, shame or awkwardness; 
or whether you are in complete balance.  Then make your choice. 

Thank you.

(Sohrab now channels)

The child prodigy within you is now awakening.  Listen to our words 
carefully:  The child prodigy within you.  Here, the energy of the child refers 
to your inner enthusiasm, vibrancy, passion, sense of feeling carefree, and 
sense of feeling that you can achieve anything you desire.  The prodigy 
refers to innate talents you already have, which you have only explored to a 
small degree; or to talents that  you are unaware you even have. 

The child prodigy within you is beginning to awaken.  We urge all of you to 
tap into this and begin to exercise it during 2017.   This has no bearing on 
trying to reach the entire world.  It’s about exploring the skills and the 
magnificence you have, and to exercise them so powerfully that they reach 
out and change the world.

(Smiling) We can hear your thoughts.  Yes, we are eavesdropping. 
(Laughter)  So many of you are thinking, “What talent do I have?”  Everyone 
has talents.  Some are marvelous cooks.  Others excel in nurturing, healing 
or guiding people.  Some are skilled listeners.  Others are able to inspire 
others to shift and move forward.  Some lead by setting examples.   Talents 



are not just reserved for the performing arts.  Think out of the box. 

Look for them, discover them, and exercise them.  Lightworkers are of 
prime importance during 2017.  He has already spoken of the parallel 
existences during this coming year.  Many will be floundering in the mire.   
Inspire them.  Help them see there is an alternative course that they can 
take, by shifting their perception.  Motivate them to rise up and join you on 
the higher-frequency road. 

Be very careful, however, as you will feel urged to rescue others.   You may 
guide, advise, motivate and even show them the way; but you cannot rescue 
them.   You cannot reach down and pluck them out of the muck.  This will 
not be permitted, because they have to do that.  They have to learn to raise 
their vibrations, shift perception and choose the higher road.   Only then will 
they learn.

You will be called upon, virtually daily in 2017, to guide, advice, counsel, 
suggest, urge and motivate others.  Sometimes you will have to shake them 
up.  But you cannot rescue them.

Be the magnificent beings that you are.

BLESSINGS.

SAI KA PRANAM.

                                          **********************


